






















Gitarani Devi <lgitarani@shivaji.du.ac.in>

Fwd: FW: Thermo
1 message

Gitarani Leisangthem <git_leisa@yahoo.com> Fri, Oct 16, 2020 at 7:49 PM
To: "lgitarani@shivaji.du.ac.in" <lgitarani@shivaji.du.ac.in>

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Rashmi Wardhan <rashmiwardhan56@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, October 16, 2020 4:23:06 PM
To: Gitarani <git_leisa@yahoo.com>
Subject: Fwd: FW: Thermo

PFA
---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: suman kundu <suman.kundu@south.du.ac.in>
Date: Fri, Mar 20, 2020 at 11:18 AM
Subject: Fwd: FW: Thermo
To: Rashmi Wardhan <rashmiwardhan56@gmail.com>

Thermo fund transferred

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Pattanaik, Sangram <sangram.pattanaik@thermofisher.com>
Date: Fri, 20 Mar 2020, 10:52
Subject: FW: Thermo
To: suman kundu <suman.kundu@south.du.ac.in>

Sir,

It is transferred .

sangram

From: Avasthi, Abhishek V. <abhishek.avasthi@thermofisher.com>
Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 10:42 AM
To: Pattanaik, Sangram <sangram.pattanaik@thermofisher.com>
Cc: Kumar, Pradeep <pradeep.kumar@thermofisher.com>
Subject: FW: Thermo
Importance: High

Hi Sangram,

Shivaji College Mail - Fwd: FW: Thermo https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1?ik=2a99c4fdde&view=pt&search=all&...

1 of 5 16-10-2020, 08:00 pm



Please find below details of online transfer of funds for our sponsorship towards the conference

Name Reference Transfer Date Amount  (Rs.) UTR NO

Shivaji College SH/ADM/333/2020 19 MAR 2020 98000 HSBCN20078294263

Mandatory TDS
Amount (Rs.) Mandatory TDS %

2000 2.00%

Regards,

Abhishek
+91 7506247277

From: suman kundu <suman.kundu@south.du.ac.in>
Sent: 15 February 2020 12:45
To: Avasthi, Abhishek V. <abhishek.avasthi@thermofisher.com>; Pattanaik, Sangram <sangram.pattanaik@
thermofisher.com>
Cc: Rashmi Wardhan <rashmiwardhan56@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Thermo

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Thermo Fisher Scientific. If you believe it to be suspicious, report
using the Report Phish button in Outlook or send to SOC@thermofisher.com.

We had a wonderful programme, with some of the best in India and abroad with us. The programme is attached
herewith. We missed your presence sorely.  Please release the sponsorship so that we can complete our logistics.

Thanks and regards

Suman 

On Wed, Feb 5, 2020 at 2:52 PM Rashmi Wardhan <rashmiwardhan56@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Abhiskek 
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Kindly send the speaker name for the conference and we hare dispatching hard copies .

regard

Dr.rashmi wardhan

On Wed, Feb 5, 2020 at 2:31 PM Avasthi, Abhishek V. <abhishek.avasthi@thermofisher.com> wrote:

Dear Dr Rashmi,

Thank you for sharing the soft copy of Sponsorship letter

Please find below address for sending Hard copy Of Sponsorship letter

Kind Attn: Abhishek Avasthi 

Thermo Fisher Scientific India Pvt. Ltd.

402, B Wing, Delphi, Hiranandani Business Park, Powai,
Mumbai 400076 India

Tel: +91-22-6680 2121

Mobile +91-750 624 7277     

Regards,

Abhishek
+91 7506247277

From: Rashmi Wardhan <rashmiwardhan56@gmail.com>
Sent: 05 February 2020 14:16
To: Avasthi, Abhishek V. <abhishek.avasthi@thermofisher.com>; Pattanaik, Sangram <sangram.pattanaik@
thermofisher.com>
Cc: suman kundu <suman.kundu@south.du.ac.in>
Subject: Fwd: Thermo

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Thermo Fisher Scientific. If you believe it to be suspicious,
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report using the Report Phish button in Outlook or send to SOC@thermofisher.com.

Dear Mr abhishek 

Please find required documents for releasing sponsorship money for international conference .

regards 

--

Dr. Rashmi Wardhan

Associate Professor

Department of Biochemistry

Shivaji College, University of Delhi 

M 9811509435

--

Dr. Rashmi Wardhan

Associate Professor

Department of Biochemistry

Shivaji College, University of Delhi 

M 9811509435

--

Suman Kundu, Ph.D
Professor
Department of Biochemistry
University of Delhi South Campus
Benito Juarez Road, Dhaula Kuan
New Delhi - 110021, India
Alternate E-mail: sumankundu7@gmail.com
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Tel: 91-11-24112081  (Internal : 7222)
Fax: 91-11-24115270

Website :  http://biochem.du.ac.in/web/

............................................................
Experiments are the only source of knowledge at our disposal, the rest is poetry, imagination    - Max Planck

............................................................

Editor-in-Chief

Journal of Proteins and Proteomics (JPPS)

A Journal of the Proteomics Society, India

Published by Springer Nature

https://www.springer.com/biomed/journal/42485

--
Dr. Rashmi Wardhan
Associate Professor
Department of Biochemistry
Shivaji College, University of Delhi 
M 9811509435
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International Conference 

Women’s Leadership for Global Peace and Prosperity 
January 9-10, 2020 

 

WDC SPONSORSHIP AMOUNT 

S.No. Date Details of transaction Amount ( Rs.) 

1.  26/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 20 000 

2.  26/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 40 000 

3.  26/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 28 000 

4.  26/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 42 000 

5.  26/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 26 000 

6.  26/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 4 000 

7.  26/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 16 000 

 8. 26/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 2 000 

 9. 27/11/2019 RTGS DURGA CHARITABLE  2 00 000 

10. 27/11/2019 BY CASH KIOSK 22 000 

11. 13/01/2020 Central Bank of India 25 000 

 

Total amount of Rs 4 25 000/- 

 

 

 

Dr.Sunita Singh (Convener, Women’s Development Cell) 

 





STATE BANK OF INDIA                               ICOFP 

            (₹7000)                                            (₹6000 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

FURUSAWA JAPANESE ACADEMY 

(₹ 5000) 

WISDOM CAPITAL  

(₹ 50000) 
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